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Analysis of Balance of Payments of Indian Economy 


This book has been written primarily for the 
students those who are willing to appear 
entrance exam of Master of Business 
Administration course, it will also cater the 
requirement of undergraduate and post 
graduate students in the disciplines of 
proficiency in English language,' General 
awareness, Reasoning & general 
intelligence, Quantitative analysis etc .. 

In competitive examination it is not the 
minimum pass percentage you score that 
counts, which gives you success but the 
minimum percentage of marks you score. 
Your performance will be evaluated by the 
relative performance of the other candidates 
ap~aring in the exam. Even if you have 
secured 70 percent of marks if most of the 
candidates secure higher percentage of 
marks, your selection will be peril. So it is 
essential to know some salient characters of 
your competitive examination to achieve 
success in them. It has been our sincere wish 
that the candidate after going through this 
book would be definitely showing his/her 
superiority over others. 
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